
 
 
Founded in Grenoble, France, in 1999, Arturia specializes in the development of 
music software and hardware for professional and amateur musicians. Focusing on 
innovation, we strive to integrate the latest advances in computer music research 
and technology into our products. This involves working closely with partner 
research institutions, in the development of cutting-edge musical instruments and 
software. Operating in 55 countries, we have offices in France, USA, and Mexico. 
 

Arturia strictly enforces its intellectual property rights, including but not limited to its 
trademarks, service marks, and copyrights. This intellectual property is utilized in 
connection with the retail operations of Arturia, our authorized dealer network, and e-
commerce operations at www.Arturia.com. 

Arturia and its licensees have the exclusive right to use its intellectual property. 
Trademarks and service marks are protected under United States and international 
trademark laws. Any use of the Arturia trademarks or service marks without the 
express written permission of Arturia is subject to prosecution for trademark 
infringement. Similarly, textual, photographic and audiovisual works produced and 
published by Arturia or its licensees in any format are protected under United States 
and international copyright laws.  

Any production, copying, distribution, or display of copyrighted materials owned by 
Arturia without the express written permission of Arturia is subject to prosecution for 
copyright infringement. Arturia does not permit the use of any of its intellectual 
property on eBay without prior authorization. Arturia regularly monitors the Internet in 
order to protect its intellectual property rights, including auction sites. Unauthorized 
uses of Arturia's intellectual property will result in eBay's notification of such use and 
the possible removal of the seller’s listing.  
 
Sellers: “New” or “New Other” Arturia products can only be sold in the USA by 
authorized Arturia dealers and carry an US authorized warranty. This Limited 
Warranty is extended to the original retail purchaser only. This Limited Warranty 
cannot be transferred to anyone who may subsequently purchase this product 
including its software. Arturia does not authorize any third party, including any 
dealer, retailer or sales representative to make any warranty for Arturia, or to 
assume any liability on behalf of Arturia. Arturia may require proof of the original 
purchase date in the form of a dated copy of the original authorized dealer’s invoice 
or sales receipt. This is a LIMITED WARRANTY.  Details at 
https://www.arturia.com/warrantypolicy 
 
 
Questions regarding this policy may be directed to  
ralph.goldheim@arturia.com 
President US Operations 
818-741-3065 



Or by mail at: 
 
Arturia US 
577-D Lindero Cyn Rd #239 
Westlake Village, CA 91362 
 
 

 
 
 


